
Northern Strands Group of Companies 

Modern Slavery Report (FY ending January 31, 2024) 

This document is prepared for the Northern Strands Group of Companies ("NSGC") for the fiscal year 
February 1, 2023 to January 31, 2024, under the Fighting Against Forced Labour and Child Labour in 
Supply Chains Act ( the" Act"). 

STRUCTURE, ACTIVITIES & SUPPLY CHAINS 

Our Structure: 

The Northern Strands Group of Companies is comprised of the following reporting entities: Northern 
Strands Co. Ltd. ( 11 Northern Strands"), Fortis Engineering & Manufacturing Inc. ( 1

1 Fortis") and Certified 
Mining and Construction Sales and Rentals Inc. ( 11Certified"). 

Northern Strands was incorporated in 1970 serving the potash mining industry in Saskatchewan by 
supplying mining ropes for shaft conveyances. The company continued to grow with the industry and 
expanded into construction providing expertise in rigging and lifting products and services. In 2006, 
Fortis was incorporated to provide custom engineered machined and fabricated mining attachments. 
Fortis continued to grow and is now a leading service provider for mining projects in Canada along with 
providing specialized mining services globally. In 2011, Northern Strands spun off its equipment rental 
division by incorporating Certified. The business grew to include the recertification of rental equipment 
and expanded to recertification of customer's equipment. Today Certified offers equipment rentals, 
sales and recertifications and specializes in having niche underground-ready mining equipment 
available. 

NSGC employs approximately 200 people in Canada. The majority of our workforce is based out of our 
head office location in Saskatoon, Saskatchewan. Several divisions do provide contracting and 
subcontracting services to global customers on a project basis whereby our Canadian employees travel 
to sites to perform services. NSGC has fair and responsible employment practices in place, compliant 
with all applicable legislation and employment regulations, to protect and promote workers' rights. 

Our Activities: 

NSGC is the comprehensive solution for all projects in the mining and construction industries. Northern 
Strands specializes in rigging, lifting, working at heights, agriculture terminal maintenance and safety 
training. Northern Strands provides mining ropes and attachments both to Canadian mines as well as 
global customers. The majority of our products are procured from Canada, USA, Germany and the 
United Kingdom. Additionally, Northern Strands purchases specific items from China, Turkiye and India. 

Fortis has a global focus offering contracting, subcontracting and consulting services to customers in the 
mining industry as well as major utility corporations. In addition, Fortis' capabilities encompass 
engineering, machining, fabrication and recertification of mining attachments. Fortis purchases steel 
products for use in machining and fabrication from local Canadian and US-based steel distribution 
companies. 
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